
Decisions on planning applications accompanied by an Environmental Impact 
Assessment Report (EIAR) 

 
Notice is hereby given pursuant of Part II, Amendment of Miscellaneous Enactments 
of S.I. No. 352; Section 10 of the European Communities (Public Participation) 
Regulations 2010, Section 34(1A) of the Planning Development Act 2000 (as 
amended) and Section 172(1) of the Planning Development Act 2000 (as amended), 
that  
 

Kildare County Council made a decision to GRANT planning permission for the 
following on the 15th October 2024 
Planning Ref:   23/60256 
Applicant:      McKenna Haulage Limited    
Development :  
Kildare County Council made a decision to Grant planning permission for the 
following on the 15th October 2024 

(i) Extension to the existing sand and gravel pit with an extraction area of 4.890 
hectares; (ii) Use of the existing sand and gravel pit for processing, storage of 
processed and unprocessed aggregates over an area of 4.681 hectares; (iii) 
Provision of mobile screening plant (no washing of aggregates will take place on site) 
and installation of a wheelwash within the existing sand and gravel pit; (iv) 
Restoration of the existing sand and gravel pit and proposed extension area to 
agricultural use with a total area of 9.571 hectares; (v) and all other ancillary site 
development works and activities associated with the proposed development. The 
duration for which the planning permission is sought is ten (10) years. Planning 
permission was previously granted for the existing sand and gravel pit and proposed 
extension area under Reg. Ref. 05/2340 as approved by An Bord Pleanala 
PL09.218352 and an extension of duration was also approved by Kildare County 
Council under Reg. Ref. 15/125 – Planning permission for both the existing sand and 
gravel pit and proposed extension have expired as has the extension of duration. No 
works have taken place since planning permission expired. An Environmental Impact 
Assessment Report (EIAR) will be submitted to the Planning Authority with the 
application. Revised by Significant Further Information which consists of the 
submission of a Site Restoration Plan. 
 
Location of Development: Ballyvass and Mullaghreelan Tds., Castledermot, 
Kildare W91ET2K 

The applicant and any person who made submissions or observations in writing to 
the planning authority in relation to the planning application in accordance with 
Section 37(1) of the Planning and Development Acts, 2000 (as amended) may 
appeal such a decision to An Bórd Pleanála. 

A person may question the validity of any decision of the Planning Authority by way 
of an application for judicial review, under Order 84 of the Rules of the Superior 
Courts (S.I. No. 15 of 1986), in accordance with section 50 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2000 as amended. 



A person may question the validity of any decision on an appeal by An Bórd Pleanála 
by way of an application for judicial review, under Order 84 of the Rules of the 
Superior Courts (S.I. No. 15 of 1986), in accordance with Section 50 of the Planning 
and Development Act, 2000 as amended. 

Information in relation to the making of an appeal may be obtained from An Bórd 
Pleanála’s website at www.pleanala.ie.  Also refer to Section 50 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2000 as amended by Sections 32 and 33 of the Planning and 
Development Act 2010 in relation to judicial review.  General information on judicial 
review procedures is contained on the following website; www.citizensinformation.ie  

Details with regard to the planning reference referred to in this notice may also be 
viewed on this website on the online planning system by entering the planning 
reference no. 23/60256 in the Planning File reference field. 
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